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Newstudy backs
earlier research
into birth control

By LAURA MECKLER
Associated Press

WASHINGTON — Teenagers at
high schools where condoms were
available were no more likelyto have
sex than other teens, a studysuggests.

The study, published yesterday,
backsearlierresearchontheprograms
developed in the 1990s to stem the
spread of the AIDS virus and reduce
teeh pregnancy. It says that students in
high ^hools with condom programs
were more likely to use con&ms,
while students in other high schools
were more likely to use other forms .of
birth control.

Overall, there was no difference in
pregnancy rates. The study could not

.determine whether there was an in
crease in sexually transmitted diseas
es.

Manyconservativeshavestaunchly
opposed condom programs, saying
they send the wrong mess^e and en
courage and'enable teens to have sex
before marriage.

Researchers writing in the Ameri
canJournal ofPublic Health examined
high schools in Massachusetts, where
the state Department of Education en

couraged schools to develop condom
programs. In most cases, the condoms
were available ffom the school nurse
or fromother personnelsuchas a gym
teacher.

Thestudytook a sampleofall high
schools, comparing students at nine
schools that made condoms available
with those at 50 schools that did not.
The data came from a 1995 survey of
students' sexual behavior.

They found students inschools with
condom programs were slightly less
likely to report having had sexual in
tercourse than those at other schools.
Specifically, 49 percent of students at
schools that didn't distribute condoms
reported they had engaged insex, com
pared with 42 percent at schools ibat
made condoms available.

"Theconcernsofthesmallminority
of parents who oppose [)roviding con
doms or related instruction in schools
were not substantiated,"wrote leadau
thor Susan Blakeand hercolleaguesat
the George Washington University
School of Public Health and Health
Services.

The study did not compare teenage
sexual behavior before and after con
dom programs were instituted, re
searchers note, so the study does not
prove thattheprogram ch^ed any
one's behavior.

Opponents of the programs cited
that weaknessincriticizing the study.

"If you look behind the headlines,
you'll see'this study is much ado about
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The study did not
compare teens'
habits before and
after condom
programs began,
soitdoesnot
prove the program
aitered behavior.

nothing," said a statement from Ken
Connor, president of the Family Re
search Council,a conservativegroup.

Connor said making condoms
available"sends kids the wrong mess
age and gives them a false sense of se
curity that they will be protected."
While condoms protect against trans
mission of HIV he noted that some dis
eases can be transmitted during sex
even with a condom.

Other researchers also have found
that condom programs do not encour
age teens to have sex, but it's less clear
if they succeed in getting teens to use
them, said DouglasKirby, an experton
teen sexualityat ETR As^iates.

He said the controversysurround .
ing these programs has diminished*
overtime. Heguessedthat's largely1;^^
cause once the programs are impl^-
mented,peopleaccept them. „n >

"When you go and visit some-of ;
theseschools, as an outsideryouthink
it'sreally a bigthing, andyougoinand ,
wander intoa health clinicand yousee
a basket full of condoms, and that's it,*? '
Kirby said. "That's what all the hoopla
is for."

The Massachusetts study al^p.
found thatschools offering condomsV
alsoweremorelikelyto teachstudei)U>
how to use them properly. Studentsnt .
schools with condoms also were more '
likely to have received information >
aboutAIDS and thevirus thatcauses it. '

The study found that students at. >
schools with condom programs were*
no more likely than others to say that >
condoms were easily available, even .
though they were more likely to use
them.

Researcherssaid it might nothave. -
been that making condoms avaUabfe.
prompted teens to use them, butcpttt^
munities that werelikely to adopt tfie
programs were more likely to suppotY
condomuse to beginwith. ^

The data on teen sexual behavior .
came from the 1995 Massachusetts
Youth Risk Behavior Survey. It include'
ed interviews with 4,166 students.'
About one in five was enrolled in A'.
school with a condom-availability pnh ^
gram.
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